
Bhu Rakshak Agrotech: Terms and Conditions 

 

1. Introduction 

Welcome to Bhu Rakshak Agrotech. These Terms and Conditions outline the rules and 
regulations for the use of our products and services. By accessing or using our products, 
you agree to comply with these Terms and Conditions. If you disagree with any part of these 
terms, please do not use our products. 

 

2. Company Details 

- Company Name: Bhu Rakshak Agrotech 

- Address: Plot No 47, RS No 329B, Hubballi Road, Gadag Co-op Industrial Estate, Gadag 
Betageri, Gadag, Karnataka, 582101 

- Contact Number: +91 90369 33291 

- Email: bhurakshakagrotech@gmail.com 

 

3. Use of Products 

Our pesticides are intended for agricultural use only and should be used in accordance 
with the instructions provided. Bhu Rakshak Agrotech is not responsible for any misuse or 
unintended use of our products. 

 

4. Purchase and Payment 

- All orders are subject to product availability and confirmation of the order price.  

- Prices for our products are subject to change without notice. 

- Payment must be made at the time of purchase. Accepted payment methods will be 
communicated at the time of purchase. 

 

 

 

mailto:bhurakshakagrotech@gmail.com


5. Shipping and Delivery 

- We strive to ensure timely delivery of products. However, delivery times are estimates and 
not guaranteed. 

- Risk of loss and title for products purchased from Bhu Rakshak Agrotech pass to you upon 
delivery to the carrier. 

 

6. Returns and Refunds 

- Returns are accepted only for defective products or products damaged during shipping. 

- To be eligible for a return, the product must be unused and in the same condition that you 
received it. 

- Refunds will be processed within 3 days after we receive the returned product. 

 

7. Warranty and Liability 

- Our products come with a limited warranty against defects in material and workmanship 
under normal use. 

- Bhu Rakshak Agrotech's liability is limited to the cost of the product. We are not liable for 
any indirect, incidental, or consequential damages arising from the use of our products. 

 

8. Compliance with Laws 

You agree to comply with all applicable laws and regulations when using our products. It is 
your responsibility to ensure that the use of our products complies with all local, state, and 
national laws. 

 

9. Intellectual Property 

All intellectual property rights related to our products and services are owned by Bhu 
Rakshak Agrotech. Unauthorized use of any intellectual property, including trademarks and 
copyrighted material, is strictly prohibited. 

 

 



10. Privacy Policy 

Our privacy policy explains how we handle your personal information. By using our 
products, you consent to the collection, use, and disclosure of your personal information 
as described in our privacy policy. 

 

11. Changes to Terms and Conditions 

Bhu Rakshak Agrotech reserves the right to modify these Terms and Conditions at any time. 
Changes will be effective immediately upon posting on our website. Your continued use of 
our products signifies your acceptance of any revised Terms and Conditions.  

 

12. Governing Law 

These Terms and Conditions are governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of 
Karnataka, India. Any disputes arising out of or in connection with these terms shall be 
subject to the exclusive jurisdiction of the courts in Gadag, Karnataka. 

 

Contact Information 

If you have any questions or concerns about these Terms and Conditions, please contact 
us at: 

- Phone: +91 90369 33291 

- Email: bhurakshakagrotech@gmail.com 

 

--- 

 

By using our products, you agree to these Terms and Conditions. Thank you for choosing 
Bhu Rakshak Agrotech. 


